



ITB #:	<u>19-080V</u>	Tentative Board Meeting Date*:	<u>OCTOBER 2, 2018</u>
ITB Title:	<u>TECHNICAL CONTRACT STAFFING & CONSULTING SERVICES</u>	# Notified:	<u>765</u> # Downloaded: <u>51</u>
		# of Responses Rec'd:	<u>43</u> # of "No Bids": <u>0</u>
For:	<u>INFORMATION & TECHNOLOGY</u> (School/Department)	ITB Opening Date :	<u>SEPTEMBER 14, 2018</u>
Fund:	<u>DEPARTMENT'S OPERATING BUDGET</u>	Advertised Date:	<u>SEPTEMBER 06, 2018</u>

POSTING OF ITB RECOMMENDATION/TABULATION: ITB Recommendations and Tabulations will be posted in the Procurement & Warehousing Services and www.Demandstar.com on **September 17, 2018 @ 8:00 am** and will remain posted for 72 hours. Any person who is adversely affected by the decision or intended decision shall file a notice of protest, in writing, within 72 hours after the posting of the notice of decision or intended decision. The formal written protest shall be filed within ten (10) days after the date the notice of protest is filed. Failure to file a notice of protest or failure to file a formal written protest shall constitute a waiver of proceedings under this chapter. Section 120.57(3)(b), Florida Statutes, states that "The formal written protest shall state with particularity the facts and law upon which the protest is based." Saturdays, Sundays, state holidays and days during which the District is closed shall be excluded in the computation of the 72-hour time period provided. Filings shall be at the office of the Director of Procurement & Warehousing Services, 7720 West Oakland Park Boulevard, Suite 323, Sunrise, Florida 33351. Any person who files an action protesting an intended decision shall post with the School Board, at the time of filing the formal written protest, a bond, payable to The School Board of Broward County, Florida, (SBBC), in an amount equal to one percent (1%) of the estimated value of the contract. Failure to post the bond required by SBBC Policy 3320, Part VIII, Purchasing Policies, Section N, within the time allowed for filing a bond shall constitute a waiver of the right to protest.

(*) The Cone of Silence, as stated in the ITB / RFP / RFQ / HARD BID, is in effect until it is approved by SBBC. The Board meeting date stated above is tentative. Confirm with the Purchasing Agent of record for the actual date the Cone of Silence has concluded.

RECOMMENDATION TABULATION

VENDOR NAME(S)	ITEM AWARDED
22nd Century Technologies, Inc.	1-57
4 Best Business Corp. **	1-57
Abacus Service Corp.	1-57
Alpha 1 Staffing	1-57
B2B Technologies South, LLC	1-6; 11; 14-18; 31-32; 41-50; 52-54
Beacon Systems, Inc. **	1-57
Bleu Stream Corporation	1-57
C & C International Computers & Consultants, Inc. **	1-8; 10-12; 14-18; 21-22; 27-30; 33-57
Capgemini America, Inc. d/b/a Sogeti USA	1-19; 21-54; 57
Cogent Infotech Corp.	1-57
Dell Marketing LP	5-6; 17-18; 41-43; 47-51; 54; 57
Diane Meiller & Associates Incorporated	14-16; 41-43; 45-46; 53; 57
Force 1 Global, Inc.	1-57
Gartner Inc.	14-18; 41-46; 48-49; 53; 57
Genesis Consulting Partners LLC	1-57
Greywood Consulting, Inc.	40-43; 57
Hyper Team USA Business and IT Consulting, Inc.	1-6; 11; 13-18; 24; 26; 31-32; 40-46; 54; 57
Instaff Solutions, LLC **	2-13; 15-38; 41-57
Intelli ERP Software, LLC	1-57
JDL Technologies	5-6; 21-22; 30; 44-50
Levi, Ray and Shoup Inc.	1-18; 20-22; 30-38; 40-54; 56-57
Michael Clark LLC d/b/a Gravity IT Resources LLC	1-54; 57
Millennium Technology Group, LLC **	1-9; 13-19; 21-32; 40-46; 49-50; 56-57

The School Board of Broward County, Florida, prohibits any policy or procedure which results in discrimination on the basis of age, color, disability, gender expression, national origin, marital status, race, religion, sex or sexual orientation. Individuals who wish to file a discrimination complaint, may call the Executive Director, Benefits & EEO Compliance at 754-321-2150 or Teletype Machine (TTY) at 754-321-2158.

Individuals with disabilities requesting accommodations under the Americans with Disabilities Act (ADA) may call the Equal Educational Opportunities (EEO) at 754-321-2150 or Teletype Machine (TTY) at 754-321-2158.

ITB 19-080V - TECHNICAL CONTRACT STAFFING & CONSULTING SERVICES

Item #	4 Best Business Corp db/a 4BBCORP	22nd Technologies, Inc.	Albacus Service Corp.	Alpha 7 Staffing	B2B Technologies, LLC	Beacon Systems, Inc	Bleu Stream Corporation	C&C International Computers and Consultants	Cappellini America Inc db/a Sogeri USA	Cogent Info Tec	Dell Marketing, L P	Diana Meiler and Associates, Inc	Force 1 Global, Inc.	Garner, Inc	Genesis Consulting Partners, LLC	Graywood Consulting, Inc.	Hypeream USA Business & IT Consultants	InStaff Solutions	Intelli ERP Software LLC	JDL Technologies	Levi, Ray & Shoup	Michael Clarke LLC db/a Gravity IT Resources LLC	Millennium Technology Group LLC	Optima Global Solutions, Inc.	Packplus, Inc. db/a Josmar Medical Staffing	Precision Staffing, Inc. db/a AP Recruiters & Associates	PSR Associates, Inc.	
1	\$ 31.38	\$ 52.50	\$ 41.40	\$ 63.00	\$ 115.00	\$ 50.00	\$ 52.00	\$ 37.09	\$ 92.31	\$ 52.00	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 63.69	NO BID	\$ 70.00	NO BID	\$ 75.00	NO BID	\$ 35.00	NO BID	\$ 58.00	\$ 49.50	\$ 70.00	\$ 50.00	\$ 34.53	\$ 36.05	\$ 65.00	
2	\$ 34.38	\$ 63.00	\$ 48.30	\$ 72.51	\$ 125.00	\$ 55.00	\$ 60.00	\$ 47.31	\$ 96.92	\$ 65.00	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 90.00	NO BID	\$ 90.00	NO BID	\$ 85.00	\$ 80.00	\$ 42.00	NO BID	\$ 63.00	\$ 61.20	\$ 90.00	\$ 65.00	\$ 37.99	\$ 39.06	\$ 72.00	
3	\$ 40.38	\$ 73.50	\$ 55.20	\$ 83.66	\$ 135.00	\$ 60.00	\$ 70.00	\$ 57.32	\$ 101.54	\$ 80.00	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 100.00	NO BID	\$ 110.00	NO BID	\$ 90.00	\$ 95.00	\$ 47.00	NO BID	\$ 66.00	\$ 72.00	\$ 110.00	\$ 80.00	\$ 41.44	\$ 43.87	\$ 85.00	
4	\$ 45.38	\$ 89.25	\$ 62.10	\$ 94.82	\$ 145.00	\$ 65.00	\$ 83.00	\$ 62.81	\$ 107.69	\$ 98.00	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 115.00	NO BID	\$ 125.00	NO BID	\$ 95.00	\$ 110.00	\$ 59.00	NO BID	\$ 71.00	\$ 89.95	\$ 125.00	\$ 95.00	\$ 46.05	\$ 48.07	\$ 99.00	
5	\$ 40.48	\$ 68.25	\$ 57.96	\$ 105.97	\$ 145.00	\$ 55.00	\$ 73.20	\$ 56.03	\$ 100.00	\$ 75.00	\$ 235.00	NO BID	\$ 70.00	NO BID	\$ 100.00	NO BID	\$ 90.00	\$ 100.00	\$ 45.00	\$ 80.00	\$ 59.00	\$ 69.75	\$ 55.00	\$ 95.00	\$ 43.75	\$ 46.87	\$ 105.00	
6	\$ 44.98	\$ 78.75	\$ 66.24	\$ 128.28	\$ 155.00	\$ 65.00	\$ 79.30	\$ 67.69	\$ 107.69	\$ 108.00	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 92.00	NO BID	\$ 125.00	NO BID	\$ 100.00	\$ 115.00	\$ 49.00	\$ 90.00	\$ 65.00	\$ 77.40	\$ 65.00	\$ 115.00	\$ 46.05	\$ 51.08	\$ 145.00	
7	\$ 44.98	\$ 89.25	\$ 63.48	\$ 111.55	NO BID	\$ 70.00	\$ 80.00	\$ 63.34	\$ 107.69	\$ 90.00	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 115.00	NO BID	\$ 100.00	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 120.00	\$ 65.00	NO BID	\$ 90.00	\$ 76.50	\$ 85.00	\$ 102.00	\$ 46.05	\$ 56.25	\$ 99.00	
8	\$ 51.48	\$ 84.00	\$ 82.80	\$ 122.71	NO BID	\$ 72.00	\$ 90.00	\$ 64.72	\$ 123.08	\$ 100.00	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 175.68	NO BID	\$ 135.00	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 175.00	\$ 115.00	NO BID	\$ 82.00	\$ 94.50	\$ 95.00	\$ 150.00	\$ 52.96	\$ 62.50	\$ 120.00	
9	\$ 34.38	\$ 89.25	\$ 62.10	\$ 120.47	NO BID	\$ 73.60	\$ 80.00	NO BID	\$ 107.69	\$ 85.00	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 115.00	NO BID	\$ 100.00	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 120.00	\$ 69.00	NO BID	\$ 80.00	\$ 78.30	\$ 100.00	\$ 102.00	\$ 46.63	\$ 48.07	\$ 115.00	
10	\$ 38.38	\$ 78.75	\$ 64.86	\$ 100.40	NO BID	\$ 72.00	\$ 82.00	\$ 61.41	\$ 100.00	\$ 95.00	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 94.00	NO BID	\$ 85.00	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 120.00	\$ 69.00	NO BID	\$ 85.00	\$ 76.05	NO BID	\$ 80.00	\$ 46.63	\$ 39.06	\$ 90.00	
11	\$ 48.38	\$ 89.25	\$ 62.10	\$ 105.97	\$ 140.00	\$ 65.00	\$ 85.00	\$ 61.45	\$ 107.69	\$ 78.00	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 98.57	NO BID	\$ 85.00	NO BID	\$ 100.00	\$ 125.00	\$ 60.00	NO BID	\$ 78.00	\$ 76.05	NO BID	\$ 95.00	\$ 50.66	\$ 62.50	\$ 75.00	
12	\$ 34.48	\$ 78.75	\$ 57.96	\$ 100.40	NO BID	\$ 65.00	\$ 80.00	\$ 51.87	\$ 107.69	\$ 90.00	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 83.00	NO BID	\$ 90.00	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 120.00	\$ 65.00	NO BID	\$ 85.00	\$ 72.00	NO BID	\$ 80.00	\$ 34.53	\$ 39.06	\$ 90.00	
13	\$ 39.48	\$ 73.50	\$ 62.10	\$ 105.97	NO BID	\$ 65.00	\$ 75.00	NO BID	\$ 107.69	\$ 102.00	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 98.09	NO BID	\$ 80.00	NO BID	\$ 85.00	\$ 90.00	\$ 60.00	NO BID	\$ 72.00	\$ 69.29	\$ 75.00	\$ 95.00	\$ 32.23	\$ 36.06	\$ 85.00	
14	\$ 29.97	\$ 63.00	\$ 41.40	\$ 78.09	\$ 120.00	\$ 56.00	\$ 58.00	\$ 42.43	\$ 100.00	\$ 40.00	NO BID	\$ 140.00	\$ 65.85	\$ 255.00	\$ 90.00	NO BID	\$ 95.00	NO BID	\$ 42.00	NO BID	\$ 59.00	\$ 54.00	\$ 60.00	\$ 60.00	\$ 31.07	\$ 37.50	\$ 52.00	
15	\$ 33.73	\$ 67.20	\$ 52.44	\$ 89.24	\$ 135.00	\$ 64.00	\$ 70.00	\$ 52.06	\$ 107.69	\$ 60.00	NO BID	\$ 155.00	\$ 83.65	\$ 345.00	\$ 110.00	NO BID	\$ 105.00	\$ 90.00	\$ 47.00	NO BID	\$ 63.00	\$ 66.60	\$ 70.00	\$ 80.00	\$ 34.53	\$ 42.36	\$ 65.00	
16	\$ 37.98	\$ 76.65	\$ 62.10	\$ 100.40	\$ 150.00	\$ 72.00	\$ 80.00	\$ 60.90	\$ 115.38	\$ 75.00	NO BID	\$ 175.00	\$ 94.57	\$ 390.00	\$ 125.00	NO BID	\$ 115.00	\$ 105.00	\$ 59.00	NO BID	\$ 68.00	\$ 85.00	\$ 80.00	\$ 99.00	\$ 39.14	\$ 47.17	\$ 85.00	
17	\$ 34.98	\$ 68.25	\$ 55.20	\$ 83.66	\$ 145.00	\$ 65.00	\$ 75.00	\$ 60.86	\$ 100.00	\$ 60.00	\$ 235.00	NO BID	\$ 71.19	\$ 345.00	\$ 75.00	NO BID	\$ 100.00	\$ 105.00	\$ 49.00	NO BID	\$ 68.00	\$ 66.24	\$ 80.00	\$ 95.00	\$ 43.75	\$ 47.50	\$ 75.00	
18	\$ 41.38	\$ 81.90	\$ 63.48	\$ 100.40	\$ 160.00	\$ 70.00	\$ 85.00	\$ 70.75	\$ 107.69	\$ 80.00	\$ 298.00	NO BID	\$ 96.11	\$ 390.00	\$ 85.00	NO BID	\$ 110.00	\$ 125.00	\$ 55.00	NO BID	\$ 75.00	\$ 76.50	\$ 100.00	\$ 115.00	\$ 58.72	\$ 53.75	\$ 89.00	
19	\$ 35.38	\$ 73.50	\$ 48.30	\$ 100.40	NO BID	\$ 56.00	\$ 79.30	NO BID	\$ 107.69	\$ 65.00	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 66.00	NO BID	\$ 115.00	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 90.00	\$ 39.00	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 68.52	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 36.84	\$ 51.98	\$ 75.00	
20	\$ 32.43	\$ 63.00	\$ 48.30	\$ 94.82	NO BID	\$ 51.20	\$ 64.66	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 75.00	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 91.20	NO BID	\$ 90.00	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 100.00	\$ 33.00	NO BID	\$ 70.00	\$ 67.50	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 34.53	\$ 40.26	\$ 90.00	
21	\$ 22.23	\$ 42.00	\$ 27.60	\$ 55.78	NO BID	\$ 25.00	\$ 45.00	\$ 40.46	\$ 61.54	\$ 25.00	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 43.63	NO BID	\$ 50.00	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 50.00	\$ 33.00	\$ 65.00	\$ 29.00	\$ 35.53	\$ 50.00	\$ 40.00	\$ 23.01	\$ 18.75	\$ 38.00	
22	\$ 23.98	\$ 47.25	\$ 33.12	\$ 66.93	NO BID	\$ 30.00	\$ 55.00	\$ 47.42	\$ 69.23	\$ 42.00	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 50.99	NO BID	\$ 60.00	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 55.00	\$ 35.00	\$ 80.00	\$ 32.00	\$ 44.10	\$ 60.00	\$ 50.00	\$ 24.86	\$ 22.50	\$ 51.00	
23	\$ 32.38	\$ 52.50	\$ 55.20	\$ 105.97	NO BID	\$ 60.00	\$ 60.00	NO BID	\$ 107.69	\$ 70.00	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 62.00	NO BID	\$ 65.00	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 100.00	\$ 35.00	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 57.15	\$ 75.00	NO BID	\$ 24.16	\$ 35.45	\$ 67.00	
24	\$ 41.98	\$ 68.25	\$ 59.34	\$ 100.40	NO BID	\$ 65.00	\$ 85.00	NO BID	\$ 107.69	\$ 65.00	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 58.42	NO BID	\$ 100.00	NO BID	\$ 110.00	\$ 110.00	\$ 39.00	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 63.00	\$ 95.00	NO BID	\$ 26.47	\$ 39.06	\$ 69.00	
25	\$ 43.98	\$ 68.25	\$ 49.68	\$ 100.40	NO BID	\$ 65.00	\$ 65.00	NO BID	\$ 107.69	\$ 70.00	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 71.00	NO BID	\$ 115.00	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 90.00	\$ 40.00	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 58.50	\$ 85.00	NO BID	\$ 32.23	\$ 31.25	\$ 72.00	
26	\$ 43.98	\$ 63.00	\$ 48.30	\$ 83.66	NO BID	\$ 65.00	\$ 85.00	NO BID	\$ 100.00	\$ 65.00	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 65.00	NO BID	\$ 100.00	NO BID	\$ 110.00	\$ 110.00	\$ 39.00	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 63.00	\$ 90.00	NO BID	\$ 36.74	\$ 37.50	\$ 80.00	
27	\$ 43.98	\$ 63.00	\$ 51.06	\$ 100.40	NO BID	\$ 65.00	\$ 90.00	\$ 46.43	\$ 107.69	\$ 70.00	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 69.00	NO BID	\$ 100.00	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 90.00	\$ 35.00	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 63.00	\$ 95.00	NO BID	\$ 32.23	\$ 37.50	\$ 80.00	
28	\$ 43.98	\$ 63.00	\$ 55.20	\$ 94.82	NO BID	\$ 65.00	\$ 70.00	\$ 46.43	\$ 107.69	\$ 80.00	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 57.00	NO BID	\$ 125.00	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 90.00	\$ 37.00	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 63.00	\$ 85.00	NO BID	\$ 32.23	\$ 37.50	\$ 80.00	
29	\$ 46.98	\$ 78.75	\$ 48.30	\$ 100.40	NO BID	\$ 70.00	\$ 75.00	\$ 46.43	\$ 100.00	\$ 75.00	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 55.00	NO BID	\$ 145.00	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 135.00	\$ 39.00	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 62.10	\$ 90.00	NO BID	\$ 34.53	\$ 40.26	\$ 95.00	
30	\$ 22.38	\$ 36.75	\$ 27.60	\$ 72.51	NO BID	\$ 25.00	\$ 40.00	\$ 46.05	\$ 53.85	\$ 60.00	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 42.71	NO BID	\$ 50.00	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 80.00	\$ 30.00	\$ 55.00	\$ 55.00	\$ 40.05	\$ 65.00	NO BID	\$ 23.01	\$ 36.05	\$ 35.00	
31	\$ 31.98	\$ 73.50	\$ 62.10	\$ 100.40	\$ 145.00	\$ 64.00	\$ 65.00	NO BID	\$ 100.00	\$ 85.00	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 101.68	NO BID	\$ 115.00	NO BID	\$ 100.00	\$ 100.00	\$ 60.00	NO BID	\$ 72.00	\$ 85.00	\$ 75.00	\$ 119.00	\$ 32.23	\$ 62.50	\$ 64.00	
32	\$ 33.98	\$ 68.25	\$ 51.06	\$ 100.40	\$ 135.00	\$ 60.00	\$ 55.00	NO BID	\$ 92.31	\$ 88.00	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 90.80	NO BID	\$ 70.00	NO BID	\$ 90.00	\$ 105.00	\$ 60.00	NO BID	\$ 58.00	\$ 62.10	\$ 70.00	\$ 110.00	\$ 25.31	\$ 45.67	\$ 72.00	
33	\$ 74.98	\$ 115.50	\$ 62.10	\$ 169.56	NO BID	\$ 68.80	\$ 70.00	\$ 65.83	\$ 138.46	\$ 85.00	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 57.76	NO BID	\$ 150.00	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 175.00	\$ 149.00	NO BID	\$ 105.00	\$ 103.50	NO BID	\$ 154.00	\$ 52.96	\$ 56.25	\$ 95.00	
34	\$ 74.98	\$ 105.00	\$ 75.90	\$ 140.55	NO BID	\$ 80.00	\$ 95.16	\$ 74.43	\$ 123.08	\$ 75.00	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 101.46	NO BID	\$ 150.00	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 165.00	\$ 135.00	NO BID	\$ 105.00	\$ 103.50	NO BID	\$ 167.00	\$ 52.96	\$ 56.25	\$ 105.00	
35	\$ 74.98	\$ 120.75	\$ 75.90	\$ 140.55	NO BID	\$ 80.00	\$ 100.04	\$ 45.81	\$ 138.46	\$ 80.00	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 78.77	NO BID	\$ 150.00	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 175.00	\$ 135.00	NO BID	\$ 105.00	\$ 103.90	NO BID	\$ 167.00	\$ 52.96	\$ 56.25	\$ 105.00	
36	\$ 74.98	\$ 99.75	\$ 51.06	\$ 133.86	NO BID	\$ 80.00	\$ 96.38	\$ 56.44	\$ 123.08	\$ 60.00	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 72.53	NO BID	\$ 150.00	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 175.00	\$ 135.00	NO BID	\$ 100.00	\$ 108.00	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 52.96	\$ 42.06	\$ 99.00	
37	\$ 79.98	\$ 99.75	\$ 82.80	\$ 140.55	NO BID	\$ 80.00	\$ 97.60	\$ 149.00	\$ 138.46	\$ 70.00	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 71.00	NO BID	\$ 150.00	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 175.00	\$ 149.00	NO BID	\$ 100.00	\$ 106.20	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 52.96	\$ 56.25	\$ 110.00	
38	\$ 79.98	\$ 120.75	\$ 103.50	\$ 176.25	NO BID	\$ 80.00	\$ 115.90	\$ 60.00	\$ 153.85	\$ 90.00	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 75.92	NO BID	\$ 170.00	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 190.00	\$ 169.00	NO BID	\$ 125.00	\$ 130.05	NO BID	\$ 175.00	\$ 37.99	\$ 69.11	\$ 130.00	
39	\$ 49.98	\$ 63.00	\$ 33.12	\$ 92.00	NO BID	\$ 60.00	\$ 79.30	\$ 38.27	\$ 123.08	\$ 60.00	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 111.15	NO BID	\$ 80.00	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 74.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 80.99	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 28.77	\$ 62.50	\$ 92.00	
40	\$ 36.98	\$ 68.25	\$ 52.44	\$ 94.82	NO BID	\$ 60.00	\$ 60.00	\$ 42.86	\$ 107.69	\$ 50.00	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 65.00	NO BID	\$ 95.00	\$ 60.00	\$ 85.00	NO BID	\$ 60.00	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 70.00	\$ 54.00	\$ 60.00	\$ 65.00	\$ 37.99	\$ 43.26	\$ 68.00
41	\$ 40.98	\$ 78.75	\$ 57.96	\$ 111.55	\$ 125.00	\$ 64.00	\$ 72.00	\$ 55.54	\$ 123.08	\$ 63.25	\$ 158.00	\$ 135.00	\$ 89.69	\$ 255.00	\$ 115.00	\$ 70.00	\$ 95.00	\$ 105.00	\$ 70.00	NO BID	\$ 75.00	\$ 59.00	\$ 85.00	\$ 75.00	\$ 41.44	\$ 46.87	\$ 85.00	
42	\$ 48.48	\$ 94.50	\$ 64.86	\$ 95.00	\$ 135.00	\$ 70.40	\$ 80.00	\$ 65.98	\$ 130.77	\$ 80.50	\$ 258.00	\$ 150.00	\$ 105.93	\$ 345.00	\$ 130													

Item #	Quantix Systems, Inc.	RA Dgov, Inc.	Ranger Technical Resources, Inc.	SDTR Consulting LLC	Sierra Infosys, Inc.	Signan & Summerfield Associates, Inc.	Software Information Resource Corp-SIRC	Synchronous Solutions	Synergy Solutions Partners LLC	Tech Army, LLC	TekPartners Solutions, LLC	United Data Technologies	Vision Resources, Inc.	ViaVer and Associates, Inc.
1	\$ 40.00	\$ 54.12	\$ 48.90	\$ 50.00	\$ 75.00	\$ 45.00	\$ 69.45	\$ 60.00	\$ 70.00	\$ 84.15	\$ 55.00	NO BID	\$ 59.00	\$ 72.03
2	\$ 50.00	\$ 61.11	\$ 59.60	\$ 75.00	\$ 85.00	\$ 65.00	\$ 74.64	\$ 75.00	\$ 90.00	\$ 104.94	\$ 65.00	NO BID	\$ 69.00	\$ 80.00
3	\$ 60.00	\$ 62.38	\$ 68.00	\$ 89.67	\$ 95.00	\$ 75.00	\$ 93.97	\$ 80.00	\$ 110.00	\$ 115.83	\$ 75.00	NO BID	\$ 84.00	\$ 102.33
4	\$ 70.00	\$ 63.93	\$ 76.50	\$ 95.00	\$ 100.00	\$ 98.00	\$ 95.46	\$ 100.00	\$ 125.00	\$ 125.73	\$ 85.00	NO BID	\$ 109.00	\$ 124.46
5	\$ 60.00	\$ 68.11	\$ 59.50	NO BID	\$ 85.00	\$ 90.00	\$ 83.29	\$ 90.00	\$ 55.00	\$ 128.70	\$ 75.00	NO BID	\$ 82.00	\$ 80.50
6	\$ 70.00	\$ 69.66	\$ 72.25	NO BID	\$ 95.00	\$ 105.00	\$ 93.29	\$ 110.00	\$ 65.00	\$ 164.34	\$ 85.00	NO BID	\$ 104.00	\$ 102.44
7	\$ 100.00	\$ 78.60	\$ 76.50	\$ 91.00	\$ 110.00	\$ 90.00	\$ 92.61	\$ 110.00	\$ 85.00	\$ 138.60	\$ 85.00	NO BID	\$ 95.00	\$ 112.45
8	\$ 100.00	\$ 84.57	\$ 76.50	\$ 106.17	\$ 110.00	\$ 110.00	\$ 104.46	\$ 120.00	\$ 95.00	\$ 136.62	\$ 80.00	NO BID	\$ 110.00	\$ 118.32
9	\$ 70.00	\$ 68.71	\$ 85.00	\$ 96.52	\$ 110.00	\$ 90.00	\$ 89.77	\$ 100.00	\$ 100.00	\$ 133.65	\$ 90.00	NO BID	\$ 108.00	\$ 100.94
10	\$ 75.00	\$ 67.54	\$ 85.00	\$ 83.49	\$ 110.00	\$ 75.00	\$ 87.32	\$ 90.00	NO BID	\$ 103.95	\$ 90.00	NO BID	\$ 105.00	\$ 117.50
11	\$ 80.00	\$ 78.48	\$ 85.00	\$ 97.98	\$ 100.00	\$ 92.00	\$ 87.57	\$ 110.00	NO BID	\$ 123.75	\$ 90.00	NO BID	\$ 102.00	\$ 100.03
12	\$ 80.00	\$ 67.19	\$ 85.00	\$ 82.16	\$ 110.00	\$ 75.00	\$ 87.32	\$ 90.00	NO BID	\$ 103.95	\$ 90.00	NO BID	\$ 97.00	\$ 105.99
13	\$ 75.00	\$ 68.09	\$ 85.00	\$ 86.96	\$ 100.00	\$ 70.00	\$ 87.57	\$ 90.00	\$ 75.00	\$ 123.75	\$ 85.00	NO BID	\$ 95.00	\$ 79.97
14	\$ 60.00	\$ 53.23	\$ 72.25	\$ 73.50	\$ 80.00	\$ 55.00	\$ 69.65	\$ 55.00	\$ 60.00	\$ 100.98	\$ 70.00	NO BID	\$ 62.00	\$ 68.67
15	\$ 70.00	\$ 64.93	\$ 76.50	\$ 79.17	\$ 90.00	\$ 70.00	\$ 75.22	\$ 65.00	\$ 70.00	\$ 125.73	\$ 78.00	NO BID	\$ 84.00	\$ 82.12
16	\$ 80.00	\$ 73.40	\$ 85.00	\$ 98.64	\$ 100.00	\$ 80.00	\$ 86.15	\$ 75.00	\$ 80.00	\$ 134.64	\$ 85.00	NO BID	\$ 103.00	\$ 109.99
17	\$ 70.00	\$ 53.24	\$ 89.25	\$ 81.20	\$ 90.00	\$ 75.00	\$ 87.63	\$ 120.00	\$ 80.00	\$ 113.85	\$ 70.00	NO BID	\$ 105.00	\$ 95.99
18	\$ 80.00	\$ 67.34	\$ 97.75	\$ 98.43	\$ 110.00	\$ 85.00	\$ 98.86	\$ 135.00	\$ 100.00	\$ 128.70	\$ 80.00	NO BID	\$ 122.00	\$ 125.12
19	\$ 85.00	\$ 73.49	\$ 72.25	NO BID	\$ 100.00	\$ 65.00	\$ 80.73	\$ 75.00	\$ 90.00	\$ 115.83	\$ 70.00	NO BID	\$ 76.00	\$ 68.12
20	\$ 80.00	\$ 58.72	\$ 78.75	NO BID	\$ 75.00	\$ 85.00	\$ 74.32	\$ 90.00	NO BID	\$ 103.95	\$ 70.00	NO BID	\$ 88.00	\$ 72.66
21	\$ 35.00	\$ 48.02	\$ 55.25	\$ 48.92	\$ 75.00	\$ 35.00	\$ 46.75	\$ 55.00	\$ 50.00	\$ 64.35	\$ 45.00	\$ 100.00	\$ 46.00	\$ 55.58
22	\$ 45.00	\$ 50.35	\$ 68.00	\$ 53.46	\$ 80.00	\$ 45.00	\$ 54.98	\$ 65.00	\$ 60.00	\$ 79.20	\$ 55.00	\$ 125.00	\$ 58.00	\$ 75.34
23	\$ 50.00	\$ 59.48	\$ 85.00	NO BID	\$ 85.00	\$ 60.00	\$ 65.95	\$ 60.00	\$ 75.00	\$ 84.15	\$ 55.00	NO BID	\$ 63.00	\$ 92.46
24	\$ 50.00	\$ 59.94	\$ 76.50	\$ 96.00	\$ 75.00	\$ 75.00	\$ 84.67	\$ 90.00	\$ 95.00	\$ 133.65	\$ 70.00	NO BID	\$ 78.00	\$ 65.04
25	\$ 60.00	\$ 51.72	\$ 68.00	\$ 96.00	\$ 85.00	\$ 65.00	\$ 84.11	\$ 75.00	\$ 85.00	\$ 123.75	\$ 75.00	NO BID	\$ 67.00	\$ 60.02
26	\$ 50.00	\$ 65.90	\$ 72.25	\$ 96.00	\$ 85.00	\$ 60.00	\$ 79.97	\$ 95.00	\$ 90.00	\$ 133.65	\$ 75.00	NO BID	\$ 76.00	\$ 75.88
27	\$ 60.00	\$ 61.02	\$ 80.75	\$ 96.00	\$ 85.00	\$ 75.00	\$ 76.39	\$ 90.00	\$ 95.00	\$ 133.65	\$ 75.00	NO BID	\$ 80.00	\$ 79.43
28	\$ 70.00	\$ 61.30	\$ 85.00	\$ 96.00	\$ 85.00	\$ 65.00	\$ 84.95	\$ 100.00	\$ 85.00	\$ 123.75	\$ 80.00	NO BID	\$ 73.50	\$ 50.03
29	\$ 75.00	\$ 61.30	\$ 92.00	\$ 96.00	\$ 85.00	\$ 60.00	\$ 84.95	\$ 110.00	\$ 90.00	\$ 138.60	\$ 85.00	NO BID	\$ 84.00	\$ 55.08
30	\$ 65.00	\$ 36.06	\$ 66.50	NO BID	\$ 85.00	\$ 36.00	\$ 54.95	\$ 55.00	\$ 65.00	\$ 54.45	\$ 50.00	NO BID	\$ 48.00	\$ 45.56
31	\$ 80.00	\$ 71.06	\$ 93.50	\$ 94.66	\$ 85.00	\$ 95.00	\$ 84.89	\$ 110.00	\$ 75.00	\$ 123.75	\$ 95.00	NO BID	\$ 85.00	\$ 100.11
32	\$ 70.00	\$ 59.17	\$ 76.50	\$ 83.45	\$ 85.00	\$ 50.00	\$ 84.89	\$ 80.00	\$ 70.00	\$ 103.95	\$ 80.00	NO BID	\$ 72.00	\$ 95.67
33	\$ 125.00	\$ 90.82	\$ 76.50	NO BID	\$ 110.00	\$ 130.00	\$ 120.44	\$ 170.00	NO BID	\$ 163.35	\$ 90.00	NO BID	\$ 147.00	\$ 109.99
34	\$ 125.00	\$ 94.42	\$ 76.50	NO BID	\$ 110.00	\$ 120.00	\$ 118.45	\$ 160.00	NO BID	\$ 143.55	\$ 100.00	NO BID	\$ 152.00	\$ 110.01
35	\$ 125.00	\$ 100.15	\$ 93.50	NO BID	\$ 110.00	\$ 105.00	\$ 124.01	\$ 150.00	NO BID	\$ 158.40	\$ 110.00	NO BID	\$ 138.00	\$ 115.44
36	\$ 130.00	\$ 98.40	\$ 98.00	NO BID	\$ 110.00	\$ 120.00	\$ 125.04	\$ 165.00	NO BID	\$ 168.30	\$ 110.00	NO BID	\$ 118.00	\$ 114.89
37	\$ 120.00	\$ 103.15	\$ 98.00	NO BID	\$ 110.00	\$ 120.00	\$ 123.71	\$ 160.00	NO BID	\$ 183.15	\$ 125.00	NO BID	\$ 112.00	\$ 110.00
38	\$ 145.00	\$ 113.82	\$ 113.50	NO BID	\$ 110.00	\$ 140.00	\$ 138.72	\$ 190.00	NO BID	\$ 173.25	\$ 125.00	NO BID	\$ 132.00	\$ 140.56
39	\$ 125.00	\$ 102.20	\$ 85.00	NO BID	\$ 110.00	\$ 65.00	\$ 95.98	\$ 110.00	NO BID	\$ 84.15	\$ 90.00	NO BID	\$ 74.00	\$ 85.12
40	\$ 65.00	\$ 78.28	\$ 42.50	\$ 75.00	\$ 75.00	\$ 60.00	\$ 74.10	\$ 90.00	\$ 60.00	\$ 118.80	\$ 60.00	\$ 125.00	\$ 63.00	\$ 78.85
41	\$ 75.00	\$ 84.72	\$ 62.50	\$ 85.00	\$ 90.00	\$ 70.00	\$ 86.45	\$ 110.00	\$ 85.00	\$ 143.55	\$ 70.00	\$ 150.00	\$ 75.00	\$ 95.23
42	\$ 85.00	\$ 86.89	\$ 76.50	\$ 100.00	\$ 100.00	\$ 85.00	\$ 99.03	\$ 130.00	\$ 115.00	\$ 163.35	\$ 80.00	\$ 175.00	\$ 90.00	\$ 110.34
43	\$ 100.00	\$ 90.24	\$ 89.25	\$ 125.00	\$ 110.00	\$ 95.00	\$ 110.60	\$ 150.00	\$ 150.00	\$ 183.15	\$ 90.00	\$ 175.00	\$ 110.00	\$ 120.34
44	\$ 65.00	\$ 59.49	\$ 72.25	\$ 75.43	\$ 75.00	\$ 65.00	\$ 87.81	\$ 65.00	\$ 65.00	\$ 108.90	\$ 70.00	\$ 125.00	\$ 90.00	\$ 69.99
45	\$ 85.00	\$ 61.24	\$ 80.75	\$ 80.32	\$ 85.00	\$ 75.00	\$ 103.05	\$ 80.00	\$ 75.00	\$ 133.65	\$ 80.00	\$ 150.00	\$ 112.00	\$ 78.44
46	\$ 105.00	\$ 63.93	\$ 89.25	\$ 85.21	\$ 95.00	\$ 80.00	\$ 112.04	\$ 105.00	\$ 95.00	\$ 158.40	\$ 90.00	\$ 175.00	\$ 136.00	\$ 99.99
47	\$ 85.00	\$ 98.46	\$ 106.25	NO BID	\$ 125.00	\$ 90.00	\$ 110.97	\$ 135.00	NO BID	\$ 148.50	\$ 100.00	\$ 150.00	\$ 138.00	\$ 119.64
48	\$ 80.00	\$ 84.81	\$ 110.50	NO BID	\$ 85.00	\$ 80.00	\$ 110.97	\$ 110.00	No Bid	\$ 144.54	\$ 90.00	\$ 150.00	\$ 132.00	\$ 120.76
49	\$ 100.00	\$ 78.48	\$ 77.00	NO BID	\$ 90.00	\$ 85.00	\$ 99.75	\$ 135.00	\$ 150.00	\$ 125.73	\$ 95.00	\$ 175.00	\$ 127.00	\$ 110.32
50	\$ 80.00	\$ 69.18	\$ 72.00	NO BID	\$ 75.00	\$ 75.00	\$ 89.46	\$ 95.00	\$ 100.00	\$ 115.83	\$ 85.00	\$ 150.00	\$ 100.00	\$ 90.65
51	\$ 90.00	\$ 63.40	\$ 93.50	NO BID	\$ 85.00	\$ 90.00	\$ 94.72	\$ 110.00	\$ 120.00	\$ 158.40	\$ 85.00	\$ 125.00	\$ 110.00	\$ 100.46
52	\$ 80.00	\$ 64.78	\$ 76.50	NO BID	\$ 75.00	\$ 90.00	\$ 93.71	\$ 100.00	\$ 100.00	\$ 133.65	\$ 85.00	NO BID	\$ 105.00	\$ 89.32
53	\$ 75.00	\$ 44.18	\$ 106.25	NO BID	\$ 95.00	\$ 100.00	\$ 115.46	\$ 120.00	\$ 85.00	\$ 194.04	\$ 85.00	\$ 125.00	\$ 78.00	\$ 112.78
54	\$ 80.00	\$ 68.06	\$ 105.00	NO BID	\$ 80.00	\$ 95.00	\$ 119.37	\$ 120.00	\$ 85.00	\$ 183.15	\$ 85.00	\$ 125.00	\$ 85.00	\$ 115.34
55	\$ 85.00	\$ 77.23	\$ 114.75	NO BID	\$ 75.00	\$ 78.00	\$ 54.98	\$ 90.00	\$ 85.00	\$ 98.01	\$ 80.00	\$ 175.00	\$ 110.00	\$ 97.45
56	\$ 75.00	\$ 25.30	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 75.00	\$ 40.00	\$ 54.98	\$ 50.00	\$ 50.00	\$ 54.45	\$ 50.00	NO BID	\$ 58.00	\$ 70.12
57	\$ 150.00	\$ 55.45	\$ 102.00	NO BID	\$ 110.00	\$ 128.00	\$ 115.69	\$ 160.00	\$ 120.00	\$ 193.05	\$ 100.00	\$ 175.00	\$ 165.00	\$ 121.34

REMARK
BIDS REC
Recomm

BID REJECTION SHEET

ITB 19-080V

TECHNICAL CONTRACT STAFFING & CONSULTING SERVICES

It is recommended that for reasons stated below, the bids as stated be rejected for not complying with bid requirements.

- 1) Reject bid from **Apex Systems, LLC**.

Section 3, General Condition 45 - **CERTIFICATION REGARDING DEBARMENT, SUSPENSION, and INELIGIBILITY OR VOLUNTARY EXCLUSION - Lower Tier Covered Transactions**, states: ***Any Bid that does not include this required Form shall not be evaluated and shall not be considered for award.***

Bidder is not responsive as he failed to submit a copy of the CERTIFICATION REGARDING DEBARMENT, SUSPENSION, and INELIGIBILITY OR VOLUNTARY EXCLUSION - Lower Tier Covered Transactions form (Exhibit B)

- 2) Reject bids from **TRG, Inc.**

Bidder is not responsive as he failed to submit any of the required attachments and exhibits as per Section 2 – Submittal Requirements.

Sept 14th, 2018



ITB #:	<u>19-080-1V REBID</u>	Tentative Board Meeting Date*:	<u>OCTOBER 2, 2019</u>
ITB Title:	<u>TECHNICAL CONTRACT STAFFING & CONSULTING SERVICES</u>	# Notified:	<u>1,128</u> # Downloaded: <u>47</u>
For:	<u>INFORMATION & TECHNOLOGY</u> (School/Department)	# of Responses Rec'd:	<u>21</u> # of "No Bids": <u>0</u>
Fund:	<u>DEPARTMENT'S OPERATING BUDGET</u>	ITB Opening Date :	<u>SEPTEMBER 05, 2019</u>
		Advertised Date:	<u>AUGUST 21, 2019</u>

POSTING OF ITB RECOMMENDATION/TABULATION: ITB Recommendations and Tabulations will be posted in the Procurement & Warehousing Services and www.Demandstar.com on **September 06, 2019 @ 3:00 pm** and will remain posted for 72 hours. Any person who is adversely affected by the decision or intended decision shall file a notice of protest, in writing, within 72 hours after the posting of the notice of decision or intended decision. The formal written protest shall be filed within ten (10) days after the date the notice of protest is filed. Failure to file a notice of protest or failure to file a formal written protest shall constitute a waiver of proceedings under this chapter. Section 120.57(3)(b), Florida Statutes, states that "The formal written protest shall state with particularity the facts and law upon which the protest is based." Saturdays, Sundays, state holidays and days during which the District is closed shall be excluded in the computation of the 72-hour time period provided. Filings shall be at the office of the Director of Procurement & Warehousing Services, 7720 West Oakland Park Boulevard, Suite 323, Sunrise, Florida 33351. Any person who files an action protesting an intended decision shall post with the School Board, at the time of filing the formal written protest, a bond, payable to The School Board of Broward County, Florida, (SBBC), in an amount equal to one percent (1%) of the estimated value of the contract. Failure to post the bond required by SBBC Policy 3320, Part VIII, Purchasing Policies, Section N, within the time allowed for filing a bond shall constitute a waiver of the right to protest.

(* The Cone of Silence, as stated in the ITB / RFP / RFQ / HARD BID, is in effect until it is approved by SBBC. The Board meeting date stated above is tentative. Confirm with the Purchasing Agent of record for the actual date the Cone of Silence has concluded.

RECOMMENDATION TABULATION

VENDOR NAME(S)	ITEM AWARDED
Ask IT, Inc. **	1-57
Aspire HR **	15, 16, 33-38, 42-43, 57
Ascendo Resources, LLC **	1-57
BuzzClan, LLC	1-57
Crystal Data, LLC	1-57
Ebyte Technologies, Inc. **	1-57
Infojini, Inc.	1-57
Gateway Technical Services d/b/a DSN	1-4, 9, 11-13, 15-18, 20, 31-32, 41-43, 47-51, 54, 57
IOS Acquisition, LLC	1-57
Meridian Partners, LLC **	1-57
Novalink Solutions, LLC **	1-57
Powersolv, Inc.	1-57
Presidio Networked Solutions, LLC	1-57
Steven Douglas Associates	1-57
SMX Services & Consulting, Inc. **	1-57
TRG, Inc.	1-57
vTech Solutions, Inc.	1-57
Whitaker-Taylor, Inc.	1-6, 14-18, 21-22, 33-38, 40-46, 57

** S/M/WBE Vendors

IT IS RECOMMENDED THAT THE AWARD BE MADE TO THE ABOVE BIDDERS MEETING SPECIFICATIONS, TERMS AND CONDITIONS AND BE ADDED TO THE EXISTING AWARDED POOL OF VENDORS.

IT IS RECOMMENDED THAT FOR THE REASONS STATED ON THE ATTACHED BID REJECTION SHEET, THE BIDS AS STATED, EITHER IN THEIR ENTIRETY OR FOR A PARTICULAR ITEM(S) LISTED, BE REJECTED FOR NOT COMPLYING WITH BID REQUIREMENTS.

The School Board of Broward County, Florida, prohibits any policy or procedure which results in discrimination on the basis of age, color, disability, gender expression, national origin, marital status, race, religion, sex or sexual orientation. Individuals who wish to file a discrimination complaint, may call the Executive Director, Benefits & EEO Compliance at 754-321-2150 or Teletype Machine (TTY) at 754-321-2158.

Individuals with disabilities requesting accommodations under the Americans with Disabilities Act (ADA) may call the Equal Educational Opportunities (EEO) at 754-321-2150 or Teletype Machine (TTY) at 754-321-2158.



19-080-1V
BID REJECTIONS

1) **REJECT BID FROM MIGHTY RIVER, LLC**

Bidder did not bid on any of the line items indicated on the bid summary sheet.

2) **REJECT BID FROM MATHON ERP CORP**

PURSUANT TO SECTION 1 – BIDDER ACKNOWLEDGEMENT. “IN ACCORDANCE WITH GENERAL CONDITION 1, THIS SECTION MUST BE COMPLETED IN ITS ENTIRETY INCLUDING THE SIGNATURE OF AN AUTHORIZE REPRESENTATIVE WHERE INDICATED BELOW AND SUBMITTED WITH THE BID. FAILURE TO PROVIDE THIS DOCUMENT, WITH THE BID, WILL RESULT IN BID BEING CONSIDERED NON-RESPONSIVE”.

Bidder failed to submit the Bidder Acknowledgement document, page 1 of the ITB.

3) **REJECT BID FROM PLANTE & MORAN, PLLC**

PURSUANT TO SECTION 1: “BIDDER AGREES TO COMPLETE AND UNCONDITIONAL ACCEPTANCE OF THE CONTENTS OF ALL PAGES IN THIS INVITATION TO BID (ITB), AND ALL APPENDICES AND THE CONTENTS OF ANY ADDENDA RELEASED HERETO; BIDDER AGREES TO BE BOUND TO ANY AND ALL SPECIFICATIONS, TERMS AND CONDITIONS CONTAINED IN THE ITB, AND ANY RELEASED ADDENDA AND UNDERSTAND THAT THE FOLLOWING ARE REQUIREMENTS OF THIS ITB AND FAILURE TO COMPLY WILL RESULT IN DISQUALIFICATION OF BID SUBMITTED”

Bidder did not agree to SBBC’s General Conditions and proposed modifications to some of them.

ITB 19-080-IV - TECHNICAL CONTRACT STAFFING & CONSULTING SERVICES - Rebidding

Item #	Description	Ask IT Consulting, Inc.	Aspire HR, Inc.	Ascendo Resources, LLC	BuzzClan, LLC	Crystal Data, LLC.	Ebyte Technologies, Inc.	Infinimi, Inc.	Gateway Technical Services dba DSN	IOS Acquisition LLC	Meridian Partners, LLC	Novalink Solutions LLC	Powersolv, Inc.	Predario Networked Solutions LLC	Steven Douglas Associates	SMX Services and Consulting, Inc.	TRG, Inc.	V Tech Solutions Inc.	Whitaker-Taylor, Inc.
1	Programmer/Analyst (Entry Level)	\$43.00	No bid	\$54.45	\$43.00	\$47.00	\$37.50	\$50.00	\$42.00	\$73.00	\$70.00	\$60.00	\$62.85	\$65.00	\$65.00	\$60.00	\$40.00	\$45.00	\$130.00
2	Programmer/Analyst I	\$47.00	No bid	\$64.35	\$43.00	\$60.00	\$48.00	\$60.00	\$50.00	\$79.00	\$90.00	\$65.00	\$81.00	\$70.00	\$75.00	\$65.00	\$50.00	\$52.00	\$140.00
3	Programmer/Analyst II	\$55.00	No bid	\$74.25	\$55.00	\$70.00	\$58.00	\$70.00	\$68.00	\$85.00	\$110.00	\$74.00	\$92.50	\$75.00	\$90.00	\$70.00	\$65.00	\$58.00	\$150.00
4	Programmer/Analyst III	\$72.00	No bid	\$84.15	\$72.00	\$85.00	\$68.00	\$85.00	\$70.00	\$88.00	\$125.00	\$82.00	\$107.79	\$85.00	\$115.00	\$75.00	\$75.00	\$63.50	\$160.00
5	Specialist II	\$72.00	No bid	\$74.25	\$72.00	\$82.00	\$65.00	\$55.00	No bid	\$78.00	\$125.00	\$50.00	\$86.93	\$85.00	\$85.00	\$60.00	\$65.00	\$59.50	\$170.00
6	Specialist III	\$85.00	No bid	\$84.15	\$85.00	\$93.00	\$75.00	\$70.00	No bid	\$81.00	\$145.00	\$62.00	\$98.42	\$95.00	\$90.00	\$65.00	\$77.00	\$68.00	\$180.00
7	DB/2 Database Administrator	\$60.00	No bid	\$84.15	\$56.00	\$74.00	\$70.00	\$90.00	No bid	\$91.00	\$115.00	\$75.00	\$95.10	\$110.00	\$100.00	\$80.00	\$85.00	\$60.00	No bid
8	Business Warehouse Administrator	\$56.00	No bid	\$79.20	\$48.00	\$80.00	\$78.00	\$90.00	No bid	\$100.00	\$150.00	\$85.00	\$112.12	\$90.00	\$100.00	\$100.00	\$100.00	\$60.00	No bid
9	SQL Database Administrator	\$65.00	No bid	\$89.10	\$65.00	\$76.00	\$70.00	\$85.00	\$75.00	\$88.00	\$110.00	\$75.00	\$100.69	\$110.00	\$100.00	\$80.00	\$85.00	\$55.00	No bid
10	UNIX/AIX Systems Administrator	\$62.00	No bid	\$89.10	\$62.00	\$90.00	\$62.00	\$85.00	No bid	\$76.00	\$100.00	\$65.00	\$92.39	\$105.00	\$90.00	\$95.00	\$72.00	\$57.00	No bid
11	Senior .Net Developer	\$77.00	No bid	\$89.10	\$77.00	\$77.00	\$67.00	\$90.00	\$72.00	\$94.00	\$120.00	\$100.00	\$102.87	\$85.00	\$105.00	\$80.00	\$75.00	\$60.00	No bid
12	Linux System Administrator	\$76.00	No bid	\$89.10	\$76.00	\$75.00	\$55.00	\$90.00	\$68.00	\$77.00	\$100.00	\$68.00	\$88.30	\$95.00	\$90.00	\$85.00	\$72.00	\$60.00	No bid
13	PHP Web Developer	\$70.00	No bid	\$84.15	\$70.00	\$73.00	\$50.00	\$90.00	\$60.00	\$72.00	\$150.00	\$67.00	\$91.29	\$70.00	\$95.00	\$75.00	\$68.00	\$51.00	No bid
14	Business Analyst I	\$56.00	No bid	\$69.30	\$56.00	\$57.00	\$45.00	\$55.00	No bid	\$74.00	\$125.00	\$55.00	\$70.20	\$55.00	\$65.00	\$75.00	\$50.00	\$48.00	\$140.00
15	Business Analyst II	\$65.00	\$190.00	\$77.22	\$65.00	\$67.00	\$58.00	\$70.00	\$66.00	\$79.00	\$150.00	\$65.00	\$82.14	\$70.00	\$85.00	\$80.00	\$60.00	\$55.00	\$150.00
16	Business Analyst III	\$79.00	\$200.00	\$84.15	\$79.00	\$80.00	\$68.00	\$90.00	\$70.00	\$86.00	\$175.00	\$75.00	\$98.00	\$90.00	\$95.00	\$85.00	\$72.00	\$60.00	\$160.00
17	Systems Engineer	\$63.00	No bid	\$69.30	\$63.00	\$62.00	\$50.00	\$70.00	\$65.00	\$68.00	\$150.00	\$70.00	\$92.58	\$95.00	\$90.00	\$75.00	\$70.00	\$55.50	\$160.00
18	Sr. Systems Engineer	\$78.00	No bid	\$79.20	\$78.00	\$77.00	\$60.00	\$85.00	\$73.00	\$100.00	\$175.00	\$84.00	\$112.11	\$130.00	\$105.00	\$85.00	\$75.00	\$62.00	\$170.00
19	Budget Analyst IV	\$45.00	No bid	\$69.30	\$45.00	\$43.00	\$68.00	\$70.00	No bid	\$72.00	\$110.00	\$65.00	\$73.21	\$105.00	\$75.00	\$100.00	\$69.75	\$60.00	No bid
20	Tele-Communications Analyst IV	\$36.00	No bid	\$69.30	\$36.00	\$33.00	\$65.00	\$90.00	\$85.00	\$65.00	\$90.00	\$84.00	\$67.99	\$90.00	\$90.00	\$65.00	\$55.00	\$62.00	No bid
21	Technician I	\$24.00	No bid	\$44.55	\$23.00	\$22.00	\$28.00	\$40.00	No bid	\$48.00	\$50.00	\$35.00	\$47.41	\$40.00	\$50.00	\$45.00	\$38.00	\$30.00	\$100.00
22	Technician II	\$30.00	No bid	\$54.45	\$30.00	\$29.00	\$33.00	\$50.00	No bid	\$56.00	\$55.00	\$42.00	\$56.10	\$55.00	\$65.00	\$55.00	\$45.00	\$35.00	\$120.00
23	Digital Media Developer	\$34.00	No bid	\$54.45	\$34.00	\$28.00	\$35.00	\$65.00	No bid	\$62.00	\$75.00	\$70.00	\$67.44	\$80.00	\$85.00	\$60.00	\$62.00	\$29.10	No bid
24	Interactive Web-Based Training Developer	\$67.00	No bid	\$69.30	\$67.00	\$68.00	\$63.00	\$70.00	No bid	\$70.00	\$80.00	\$71.00	\$87.02	\$85.00	\$90.00	\$90.00	\$69.00	\$40.00	No bid
25	Interactive Web-Based Trainer	\$46.00	No bid	\$74.25	\$46.00	\$62.00	\$60.00	\$70.00	No bid	\$70.00	\$85.00	\$70.00	\$80.38	\$80.00	\$80.00	\$90.00	\$65.00	\$43.00	No bid
26	Online Course Developer	\$47.00	No bid	\$74.25	\$47.00	\$45.00	\$45.00	\$70.00	No bid	\$68.00	\$100.00	\$70.00	\$78.92	\$80.00	\$85.00	\$90.00	\$70.00	\$45.00	No bid
27	Training Program Developer	\$48.00	No bid	\$74.25	\$48.00	\$50.00	\$48.00	\$80.00	No bid	\$68.00	\$100.00	\$70.00	\$76.91	\$85.00	\$95.00	\$90.00	\$72.00	\$45.00	No bid
28	Training Program Deliverer	\$46.00	No bid	\$79.20	\$46.00	\$49.00	\$48.00	\$80.00	No bid	\$68.00	\$125.00	\$70.00	\$78.49	\$80.00	\$90.00	\$90.00	\$72.00	\$50.00	No bid
29	Training Program Evaluator	\$44.00	No bid	\$84.15	\$44.00	\$44.00	\$48.00	\$80.00	No bid	\$80.00	\$145.00	\$70.00	\$86.18	\$80.00	\$85.00	\$90.00	\$72.00	\$30.00	No bid
30	Computer Operator (Operations Center)	\$22.00	No bid	\$49.50	\$22.00	\$22.00	\$35.00	\$45.00	No bid	\$46.00	\$50.00	\$35.00	\$51.83	\$75.00	\$80.00	\$50.00	\$45.00	\$28.00	No bid
31	Web Applications Developer	\$68.00	No bid	\$94.05	\$68.00	\$65.00	\$65.00	\$85.00	\$65.00	\$72.00	\$100.00	\$70.00	\$95.94	\$90.00	\$100.00	\$80.00	\$75.00	\$48.00	No bid
32	Web Designer	\$60.00	No bid	\$79.20	\$60.00	\$64.00	\$65.00	\$85.00	\$58.00	\$67.00	\$100.00	\$60.00	\$82.50	\$85.00	\$85.00	\$80.00	\$78.00	\$45.00	No bid
33	SAP Configuration Analyst	\$94.00	\$200.00	\$89.10	\$94.00	\$100.00	\$72.00	\$105.00	No bid	\$110.00	\$180.00	\$70.00	\$106.86	\$80.00	\$95.00	\$90.00	\$139.00	\$80.00	\$150.00
34	SAP BASIS Administrator	\$73.00	\$200.00	\$99.00	\$73.00	\$72.00	\$77.00	\$125.00	No bid	\$108.00	\$150.00	\$85.00	\$118.92	\$90.00	\$105.00	\$95.00	\$120.00	\$60.00	\$150.00
35	SAP Security Administrator	\$80.00	\$200.00	\$108.90	\$80.00	\$83.00	\$80.00	\$145.00	No bid	\$119.00	\$175.00	\$80.00	\$119.85	\$105.00	\$110.00	\$100.00	\$126.00	\$63.00	\$150.00
36	SAP Workflow Coordinator	\$48.00	\$195.00	\$108.90	\$44.00	\$42.00	\$68.00	\$125.00	No bid	\$105.00	\$175.00	\$60.00	\$112.29	\$80.00	\$90.00	\$70.00	\$140.00	\$40.00	\$150.00
37	SAP Employee Self-Service Administrator	\$76.00	\$200.00	\$123.75	\$76.00	\$75.00	\$75.00	\$125.00	No bid	\$102.00	\$175.00	\$65.00	\$124.41	\$85.00	\$100.00	\$95.00	\$135.00	\$41.00	\$150.00
38	SAP Project Manager	\$98.00	\$220.00	\$123.75	\$98.00	\$81.00	\$85.00	\$125.00	No bid	\$115.00	\$195.00	\$100.00	\$136.50	\$100.00	\$130.00	\$120.00	\$145.00	\$75.00	\$175.00
39	iXOS Administration Coordinator	\$32.00	No bid	\$89.10	\$32.00	\$32.00	\$50.00	\$125.00	No bid	\$62.00	\$110.00	\$45.00	\$80.17	\$85.00	\$75.00	\$90.00	\$80.00	\$30.00	No bid
40	Project Manager (Entry Level)	\$60.00	No bid	\$59.40	\$54.00	\$52.00	\$55.00	\$125.00	No bid	\$72.00	\$125.00	\$69.00	\$76.25	\$70.00	\$65.00	\$100.00	\$50.00	\$50.00	\$150.00
41	Project Manager I	\$75.00	No bid	\$69.30	\$61.00	\$61.00	\$65.00	\$70.00	\$62.00	\$82.00	\$150.00	\$76.00	\$99.55	\$80.00	\$85.00	\$110.00	\$54.00	\$55.00	\$160.00
42	Project Manager II	\$80.00	\$220.00	\$79.20	\$75.00	\$70.00	\$75.00	\$85.00	\$66.00	\$96.00	\$175.00	\$85.00	\$113.62	\$90.00	\$95.00	\$120.00	\$59.00	\$65.00	\$170.00
43	Project Manager III	\$90.00	\$235.00	\$89.10	\$83.00	\$82.00	\$85.00	\$110.00	\$72.00	\$115.00	\$200.00	\$98.00	\$129.44	\$110.00	\$115.00	\$140.00	\$85.00	\$73.50	\$175.00
44	Technical Consultant I	\$55.00	No bid	\$69.30	\$55.00	\$68.00	\$60.00	\$65.00	No bid	\$63.00	\$125.00	\$60.00	\$78.35	\$80.00	\$80.00	\$50.00	\$65.00	\$30.00	\$140.00
45	Technical Consultant II	\$66.00	No bid	\$79.20	\$66.00	\$84.00	\$70.00	\$80.00	No bid	\$73.00	\$150.00	\$70.00	\$93.19	\$95.00	\$90.00	\$60.00	\$70.00	\$37.60	\$150.00
46	Technical Consultant III	\$82.00	No bid	\$89.10	\$82.00	\$93.20	\$80.00	\$100.00	No bid	\$83.75	\$175.00	\$80.00	\$109.65	\$110.00	\$100.00	\$70.00	\$75.00	\$48.50	\$160.00
47	Network Architect	\$90.00	No bid	\$99.00	\$83.00	\$92.00	\$68.00	\$100.00	\$72.00	\$108.00	\$175.00	\$77.00	\$119.32	\$140.00	\$120.00	\$100.00	\$79.00	\$60.00	No bid
48	Network Security Engineer	\$90.00	No bid	\$89.10	\$90.00	\$96.00	\$58.00	\$110.00	\$70.00	\$104.00	\$175.00	\$75.00	\$105.00	\$120.00	\$110.00	\$90.00	\$78.00	\$62.00	No bid
49	Senior Network Engineer	\$90.00	No bid	\$94.05	\$90.00	\$89.00	\$67.00	\$110.00	\$71.00	\$92.00	\$175.00	\$85.00	\$110.78	\$120.00	\$110.00	\$90.00	\$75.00	\$68.00	No bid
50	Network Engineer	\$65.00	No bid	\$84.15	\$65.00	\$70.00	\$61.00	\$80.00	\$59.00	\$79.00	\$150.00	\$70.00	\$93.00	\$105.00	\$100.00	\$80.00	\$69.00	\$55.00	No bid
51	VMWare Specialist	\$93.00	No bid	\$84.15	\$93.00	\$113.00	\$65.00	\$85.00	\$80.00	\$89.00	\$145.00	\$68.00	\$102.81	\$110.00	\$105.00	\$80.00	\$70.00	\$55.00	No bid
52	Storage Administrator	\$74.00	No bid	\$84.15	\$74.00	\$75.00	\$65.00	\$90.00	No bid	\$80.00	\$125.00	\$75.00	\$91.79	\$105.00	\$100.00	\$90.00	\$74.00	\$57.00	No bid
53	Identity Management Specialist	\$96.00	No bid	\$84.15	\$96.00	\$105.00	\$68.00	\$115.00	No bid	\$80.00	\$175.00	\$70.00	\$103.68	\$90.00	\$100.00	\$60.00	\$72.00	\$52.00	No bid
54	Sharepoint OnSite /Office 365	\$74.00	No bid	\$84.15	\$74.00	\$75.00	\$82.00	\$100.00	\$75.00	\$85.00	\$175.00	\$75.00	\$100.63	\$90.00	\$110.00	\$110.00	\$85.00	\$50.00	No bid
55	Digital Forensics Analyst	\$60.00	No bid	\$79.20	\$60.00	\$60.00	\$60.00	\$95.00	No bid	\$60.00	\$150.00	\$65.00	\$77.83	\$80.00	\$90.00	\$90.00	\$95.00	\$50.11	No bid
56	Video Surveillance Technician	\$25.00	No bid	\$49.50	\$23.00	\$21.00	\$37.00	\$75.00	No bid	\$52.00	\$60.00	\$50.00	\$47.50	\$50.00	\$65.00	\$60.00	\$60.00	\$34.50	No bid
57	Program Manager	\$102.00	\$250.00	\$99.00	\$105.00	\$90.00	\$95.00	\$100.00	\$68.00	\$101.00	\$225.00	\$78.00	\$137.10	\$120.00	\$120.00	\$160.00	\$78.00	\$74.50	\$175.00

REMARKS:
 BIDS RECEIVED WERE EVALUATED BY: Mayra Tobar, Purchasing Agent, PWS - Recommend the Award be made to the above Bidder(s) meeting specifications, terms, and conditions